
OFFICE OF PURCHASING 

January 6, 2016 
SEALED BID TABULATION  

Purchasing Agent: Jaye Latch 
(903)237-1324 

BID Number:     1516-08 Fleet 
Vehicles 

 

Item/ 
Qty Bidder 

Pegues Hurst Ford 
Longview, TX 

All Star Ford 
Kilgore, TX 

1 6 ½ Ton Extended Cab Pickup Truck w/ Short bed $22,973.00 $137,838.00 $22,767.00 $136,602.00 

2 1 Utility Vehicle, 4 Door, Full Size, PPV $28,400.00 NO BID 

3 1 ½ Ton Extended Cab Pick-up w/ Long bed $23,593.00 $23,632.00 

4 1  ¾ Ton Extended Cab Pick-up w/ Short bed $24,736.00 $24,233.00 

5 1 ¾ Ton Extended Cab Pick-up w/ Utility Body $30,207.00 $29,676.00 

6 1 Utility Vehicle, 4 Door, Full Size $28,400.00 NO BID 

7 1 ¾ Ton Extended Cab Pick-up 4x4 $26,599.00 $26,520.00 

8 3 1 Ton Extended Cab Pick-up w/ Utility Body $31,651.00 $94,953.00 $31,048.00 $93,144.00 

9 1 Cargo Van 4 cylinder FWD $20,445.00 $20,192.00 

10 1 1 Ton Crew Cab w/ Utility Body $42,956.00 $42,010.00 

11 6 Full Size Sedan $20,378.00 $122,268.00 $20,121.00 $120,726.00 

 

Item/ 
Qty Bidder 

Silsbee Ford 
Silsbee, TX 

Cowboy Chevrolet 
Silsbee, TX 

1 6 ½ Ton Extended Cab Pickup Truck w/ Short bed $24,304.00 $145,824.00 $22,353.00 $134,118.00 

2 1 Utility Vehicle, 4 Door, Full Size, PPV NO BID $34,396.00 

3 1 ½ Ton Extended Cab Pick-up w/ Long bed $24,657.00 NO BID 

4 1  ¾ Ton Extended Cab Pick-up w/ Short bed $24,536.00 $25,990.00 

5 1 ¾ Ton Extended Cab Pick-up w/ Utility Body NO BID NO BID 

6 1 Utility Vehicle, 4 Door, Full Size NO BID $34,792.00 

7 1 ¾ Ton Extended Cab Pick-up 4x4 $27,562.00 NO BID 

8 3 1 Ton Extended Cab Pick-up w/ Utility Body NO BID NO BID 

9 1 Cargo Van 4 cylinder FWD $20,996.00 NO BID 

10 1 1 Ton Crew Cab w/ Utility Body NO BID NO BID 

11 6 Full Size Sedan $20,277.00 $121,662.00 $19,237.00 $115,422 

 
*Offers listed herein tabulated were received as of the bid opening date. All other offers are declared non-responsive and 
are hereby rejected 



OFFICE OF PURCHASING 

January 6, 2016 
SEALED BID TABULATION  

Purchasing Agent: Jaye Latch 
(903)237-1324 

BID Number:     1516-08 Fleet 
Vehicles 

 

Item/ 
Qty Bidder 

Grapevine DCJ, LLC 
Grapevine, TX 

Sam Pack’s Five Star Ford 
Carrollton, TX 

1 6 ½ Ton Extended Cab Pickup Truck w/ Short bed $22,109.00 $132,654.00 NO BID 

2 1 Utility Vehicle, 4 Door, Full Size, PPV NO BID $33,074.00 

3 1 ½ Ton Extended Cab Pick-up w/ Long bed NO BID NO BID 

4 1  ¾ Ton Extended Cab Pick-up w/ Short bed NO BID $25,723.02 

5 1 ¾ Ton Extended Cab Pick-up w/ Utility Body NO BID $30,657.02 

6 1 Utility Vehicle, 4 Door, Full Size $28,627.00 $33,179.00 

7 1 ¾ Ton Extended Cab Pick-up 4x4 NO BID $27,846.00 

8 3 1 Ton Extended Cab Pick-up w/ Utility Body NO BID $32,140.69 $96,422.07 

9 1 Cargo Van 4 cylinder FWD NO BID $21,604.08 

10 1 1 Ton Crew Cab w/ Utility Body NO BID $47,436.90 

11 6 Full Size Sedan $23,948.00 $143,688.00 $20,381.17 $122,287.02 

 

Item/ 
Qty Bidder 

Caldwell Country Chevrolet 
Caldwell, TX 

Caldwell Country Ford 
Rockdale, TX 

1 6 ½ Ton Extended Cab Pickup Truck w/ Short bed $22,388.00 $134,328.00 $22,910.00 $137,460.00 

2 1 Utility Vehicle, 4 Door, Full Size, PPV $33,870.00 NO BID 

3 1 ½ Ton Extended Cab Pick-up w/ Long bed NO BID $23,315.00 

4 1  ¾ Ton Extended Cab Pick-up w/ Short bed $25,650.00 $24,885.00 

5 1 ¾ Ton Extended Cab Pick-up w/ Utility Body NO BID $30,488.00 

6 1 Utility Vehicle, 4 Door, Full Size $33,585.00 $29,910.00 

7 1 ¾ Ton Extended Cab Pick-up 4x4 $27,940.00 $26,776.00 

8 3 1 Ton Extended Cab Pick-up w/ Utility Body $32,445.00 $97,335.00 $31,690.00 $95,070.00 

9 1 Cargo Van 4 cylinder FWD $20,588.00 $22,585.00 

10 1 1 Ton Crew Cab w/ Utility Body $44,275.00 $43,935.00 

11 6 Full Size Sedan $20,415.00 $122,490.00 $20,475.00 $122,850.00 

 
*Offers listed herein tabulated were received as of the bid opening date. All other offers are declared non-responsive and 
are hereby rejected 



OFFICE OF PURCHASING 

January 6, 2016 
SEALED BID TABULATION  

Purchasing Agent: Jaye Latch 
(903)237-1324 

BID Number:     1516-08 Fleet 
Vehicles 

 

Item/ 
Qty Bidder 

Randall Reed’s Prestige Ford 
Garland, TX 

Peter’s Chevrolet 
Longview, TX 

1 6 ½ Ton Extended Cab Pickup Truck w/ Short bed $22,750.00 $136,500.00 $23,688.20 $142,129.20 

2 1 Utility Vehicle, 4 Door, Full Size, PPV $28,400.00 $33,655.80 

3 1 ½ Ton Extended Cab Pick-up w/ Long bed $23,980.00 NO BID 

4 1  ¾ Ton Extended Cab Pick-up w/ Short bed $24,600.00 $26,056.26 

5 1 ¾ Ton Extended Cab Pick-up w/ Utility Body $29,400.00 $31,546.90 

6 1 Utility Vehicle, 4 Door, Full Size $26,860.00 $33,220.20 

7 1 ¾ Ton Extended Cab Pick-up 4x4 $27,150.00 $28,921.30 

8 3 1 Ton Extended Cab Pick-up w/ Utility Body $30,700.00 $92,100.00 $29,299.40 $88,498.20 

9 1 Cargo Van 4 cylinder FWD $20,600.00 $20,324.00 

10 1 1 Ton Crew Cab w/ Utility Body $44,780.00 $42,963.36 

11 6 Full Size Sedan $20,450.00 $122,700.00 NO BID 

 

Item/ 
Qty Bidder 

Peter’s Chrysler Jeep Dodge Ram 
Longview, TX 

 

1 6 ½ Ton Extended Cab Pickup Truck w/ Short bed $20,879.00 $125,274.00   

2 1 Utility Vehicle, 4 Door, Full Size, PPV NO BID  

3 1 ½ Ton Extended Cab Pick-up w/ Long bed NO BID  

4 1  ¾ Ton Extended Cab Pick-up w/ Short bed NO BID  

5 1 ¾ Ton Extended Cab Pick-up w/ Utility Body NO BID  

6 1 Utility Vehicle, 4 Door, Full Size NO BID  

7 1 ¾ Ton Extended Cab Pick-up 4x4 NO BID  

8 3 1 Ton Extended Cab Pick-up w/ Utility Body NO BID   

9 1 Cargo Van 4 cylinder FWD $21,605.00  

10 1 1 Ton Crew Cab w/ Utility Body $46,691.00  

11 6 Full Size Sedan $22,048.00 $132,288.00   

 
*Offers listed herein tabulated were received as of the bid opening date. All other offers are declared non-responsive and 
are hereby rejected 
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